

TOWN OF CULPEPER ANNUAL WATER & WASTEWATER CHEMICAL BIDS - MAY 28, 2019

DES-19-38002

Company	Unit of Measure				Aluminum Chloride Hydroxide Sulfate	12% Hypo Chlorite	Hydrated Lime	Non-Copper Based Algaecide	Hydrofluosilicic Acid	Nonionin Coalag. Polymer	Corrosion Inhibitor	Potassium Permanganate	Powdered Activated Carbon	Caustic Soda 25%	Glycerin	Aluminum Sulfate	NE-1281 Polymer	NE-1280 Polymer	Alternate
	Tons				lbs	lbs	lbs	lbs	lbs	lbs	lbs	lbs	lbs	lbs	Tons	Tons	lbs	lbs	
	Orig + 1	Bid Form	Vendor Info	MSDS/NSF 60	1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8	9	10	11	12	13	14	
Affinity Chemical, LLC	X	X	X	X	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	355.000	NO BID	NO BID	
American Water Chemicals, Inc	X	X	X	X	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	0.614	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
Biosafe Systems	X	X	X	X	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	2.150	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
Brenntag Northeast, LLC	X	X	X	X	NO BID	NO BID	0.249	NO BID	0.388	NO BID	NO BID	1.660	0.730	0.377	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC	X	X	X	X	*620.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	290.000	NO BID	NO BID	*#1 Hyper+lon
Environmental Operating Solutions, Inc	X	X	X	X	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	336.590	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	1.72 per gallon
GEO Specialty Chemicals	X	X	X	X	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	441.820	NO BID	NO BID	
George S Coyne Chemical Co., Inc	X	X	X	X	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	1.3678	0.6594	1.8735	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
Industrial Chemicals, Inc	X	X	X	X	NO BID	NO BID	0.175	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	0.725	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
Kemira Water Solutions					NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
Kuehne Chemical Co. Inc.	X	X	X	X	NO BID	0.200	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
Momar, Inc	X	X	X	X	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	2.040	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	321.170	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Glycerin price 1.54 per gallon
Polydyne, Inc.	X	X	X	X	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	0.990	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	370.000	NO BID	1.120	1.120	
Shannon Chemical Corporation	X	X	X	X	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	0.737	1.580	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
Solenis LLC	X	X	X	X	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	*1.49	**1.31	*Praestol K260 FL Polymer, **Zetag 8848FS Polymer
Suffolk Sales & Services	X	X	X	X	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	288.200	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Note: 1.41 per gallon or .1441 per pound
Univar Solutions	X	X	X	X	*490.00	0.150	0.240	1.717	0.410	1.370	0.5616	1.610	0.730	0.240	459.000	292.100	NO BID	NO BID	*#1 Univar Coagulant 1908
USALCO	X	X	X	X	346.000	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	306.690	NO BID	NO BID	

INDICATES LOWEST BIDDER  
 All bids rejected/No award for Item 4 & 11 due to change and clarification in specifications. New Solicitation to be prepared.